
City of Santa Ana Bid Results for Project Animal Feed, Hay and Tack (21-035)
Issued on 03/09/2021, Bid Due on April 01, 2021  2:00 PM (PDT)

Line Totals (Unit Price * Quantity)

Item Description UOM QTY
Newco 
Distributors

Midway City Feed 
Company, Inc.

Kruse Feed & 
Supply, Inc.

1 ALFALFA HAY #1 GRADE PREMIUM APPROX. DIMENSION      BALE 1 no bid $20.00 $20.00
2 BIRD GRIT, 50LB BAG 1 $7.69 $12.50 $13.20
3 CHICKEN SCRATCH, 50LB BAG 1 $12.07 $15.00 $19.90
4 COSEQUIN EQUINE POWDER, 1400 GRAM CNTR 1 no bid $146.95 $185.00
5 LAMB & RICE DOG FOOD, 40LB BAG 1 $31.78 $32.50 $40.99
6 FRESH PINE BEDDING, 25LB BAG 1 $8.84 $9.50 $11.00
7 GOAT FEED, 50LB BAG 1 $23.70 $20.00 $21.70
8 DRYSTALL, 40LB BAG 1 no bid $22.50 $22.00
9 LARGE HOOKBILL CUISINE, 25LB BAG 1 $21.97 $47.50 $32.00

10 MAZURI MINI PIG, ADULT 25LB BAG 1 $14.24 $17.75 $24.00
11 MAZURI NEW WORL PRIMATE, 25LB BAG 1 $43.17 $40.00 $49.00
12 MAZURI PARROT MAINTENANCE 25LB BAG 1 $33.43 $37.00 $39.00
13 MAZURI LLAMA CHEWS, 50LBS BAG 1 $25.68 $26.00 $33.25
14 MAZURI MONKEY CRUNCH 20 BISCUIT BAG 1 $34.33 $34.00 $42.95
15 MAZURI INSECTIVORE DIET 5MK8, 25LB BAG 1 $45.70 $40.00 $43.95
16 MAZURI PETTING ZOO DIET, 50LB BAG 1 $30.16 $34.00 $39.00
17 MAZURI ADF 25 HERBIVORE 5ZZZ, 50LB BAG 1 $23.39 $30.00 $29.00
18 MAZURI EXOTIC GAMEBIRD, 50LB BAG 1 $26.45 $28.00 $29.00
19 MAZURI PRIMATE GROWTH & RE PRO BISCUITS 25 BAG 1 $24.19 $29.00 $29.00
20 MAZURI LEAFEATER MINI BISCUIT PRIMATE DIET 5672, 2BAG 1 $25.97 $28.75 $32.00
21 MAZURI PRIMATE BROWSE BISCUIT25LB BAG 1 $24.16 $39.50 $49.00
22 MAZURI TORTOISE DIET 25LB BAG 1 $29.02 $33.00 $39.95
23 MAZURI WATERFOWL MAINTENANCE 50LB BAG 1 $40.50 $43.00 $50.85
24 MAZURI ZULIFE SOFTBILL IRON, 25LB BAG 1 $41.17 $45.00 $49.00
25 MINERAL BLOCK WITH SELENIUM, 50LB BLK 1 no bid no bid $15.75
26 NASCO FROG BRITTLE LARGE NUGGETS FOR ADULT XEN  BAG 1 no bid $30.95 $39.95
27 NATURAL GLO RICE STABALIZED BRAN, 40LBS BAG 1 $17.30 $33.00 $36.99
28 ORCHARD HAY, #1 GRADE PREMIUM BALE 1 $23.71 $28.00 $30.00
29 POOP OFF REMOVER, 1 GALLON BTL 1 no bid $28.50 $74.95
30 PYRANHA WIPE N' SPRAY FLY REPELENT, 1 GALLON BTL 1 no bid $62.95 $88.99
31 RABBIT PELLETS, 50 LB BAG 1 $19.60 $16.50 $19.45
32 REDMOND ROCK LOOSE MINERAL SALT, 25 LB TUB 1 $14.99 $52.00 $48.00
33 SAND-FREE PSYLLIUM, 15 LB TUB 1 no bid $130.00 $138.00
34 SELENIUM / TRACE MINERAL BLOCK, 50 LB BLK 1 $13.92 $16.00 $15.75
35 SHREDDED ASPEN BEDDING, 25 LB BAG 1 $18.51 $16.00 $30.55
36 STALL MAT, 6 X 4 (3/4" THICK) EA 1 no bid $75.00 $60.00
37 STRAW BALE APPROX. DIMENSIONS 4' x 2' x 16? BALE 1 no bid $12.00 $15.00
38 SWAT FLY REPELLENT OINTMENT, 7 OZ. - CLEAR EA 1 no bid $15.50 $15.99
39 25 LB. SWEETLIX MEAT MAKER LOOSE MINERAL BAG 1 no bid $26.00 $29.00
40 TEKLAD MOUSE BREEDER STERILIZABLE DIET, 7004, 25 L BAG 1 $48.05 $34.00 no bid
41 TIMOTHY HAY #1 GRADE PREMIUM BALE 1 $21.61 $31.00 $32.00



42 TURKEY GAME KRACKETTS, 50 LB BAG 1 $24.63 $21.00 $25.20
43 ULTRASHIELD FLY SPRAY, 1 GALLON BTL 1 no bid $77.50 $95.99
44 WHEAT BRAN, 25 LB BAG 1 $11.90 $12.00 $22.65
45 ZUPREEM MARMOSET DIET 14.50Z 12/CS CASE 1 $19.50 $21.00 $29.00
46 ZUPREEM PRIMATE 14.50Z 12/CS CASE 1 $19.50 $21.00 $29.00
47 PLAIN WHITE SALT BLOCK, 50 LB BLK 1 $12.38 $12.50 $14.45

Newco 
Distributors

Midway City Feed 
Company, Inc.

Kruse Feed & 
Supply, Inc.

Total Bid Offer: $833.21 $1,603.85 $1,851.40
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